ANNEX A

FOI DOF/2024-0435

Request

Re: EO1 Competition IRC265807

1.

How many scheduled interviews were rearranged because of technical
difficulties?

How many candidates were successful having sat an interview rearranged
because of technical difficulties?

Of the first 1500 successful in the Aptitude Test, how many of those that had
an interview made it onto the Merit List?

And the same question in relation to the next 1500 that had an interview - how
many made it onto the Merit List?"

DoF Response

| can confirm the department holds some of the information requested.

1.

2.

3.

This information is not held.
This information is not held.

Of the first 1500 successful in the Aptitude Test, 793 candidates who had an
interview made it onto the Merit List.

Of the next 1500 that had an interview, 525 candidates who had an interview
made it onto the Merit List.



	Yours sincerely



